
 
Australian Capital Territory 

Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1957 

Ord1957-8 

Republication No 0A (RI) 

Effective:  4 July 1978  – 29 June 1981 

Republication date of printed version: 31 March 1979 
Reissued electronically: 20 January 2020 

Last amendment made by Ord1978-17 
(republication for amendments by Ord1966-19, Ord1968-5,  
Ord1974-26, Ord1976-7, Ord1977-28 and Ord1978-17) 

 

 

 

 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



 

About this republication 

The republished law 

This is a republication of the Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1957 effective 4 July 1978 to 

29 June 1981. 

Kinds of republications 

The Parliamentary Counsel’s Office prepares 2 kinds of republications of ACT laws (see the ACT 

legislation register at www.legislation.act.gov.au): 

• authorised republications to which the Legislation Act 2001 applies 

• unauthorised republications. 

The status of this republication appears on the bottom of each page. 

This republication has been scanned using the printed version. There is no unauthorised version 

available. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



 

 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



AUSTRALIAN CAPITAL TERRITORY 

SCAFFOLDING AND LIFTS ORDINANCE 1957 

Section 
1. 
2. 
3. 
4. 
5. 
6. 

Inoorporatingall amen.dmentsby legislation made to 31March1979 

Short title 
(Repealed) 
Repeal and saving 
Interpretation 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 

.PART I-PRELIMINARY 

Ordinance to bind Crown 
Appoiritment of Chiefinspector, &c. 

PART II-APPLICATION OF THE SCAFFOLDING AND LIFTS ACT 
AND REGULATIONS OF THE STATE OF NEW SOUTH WALES 

7. Application and modifications 

'' 

. 8. Interpretation 

9. Regulations 

PART Ill-REGULATIONS 

THE SCHEDULE 

PART I 

Modifications of the Scaffolding and· Lifts Act, 1.912-1948 of the State of New South Wales in 
its Application in the Territory 

PART II 

Modifications of the Scaffolding and Lifts Regulations of the State of New South Wales in 
their Application in the Territory · 

24354179 R 78/ I 3 77 Cat; No. 79 7649 3-Recommended retail price 40c 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



AUSTRALIAN CAPITAL TERRIT.ORY 

SCAFFOLDING AND LIFTS ORDINANCE 1957 

An Ordinance relating to Scaffolding, Lifts and Cranes and to Building, 
Excavation and Compressed Air Work 

PART I-PRELIMINARY 

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Scaffolding and Lifts Shorttitle · 
Ordinance 1957.1 

* * * * *' * Section2 
repealed by 
No. 28, 1977,s. ~ 

3. ( 1) Subject to the next succeeding sub-section, the Scaffolding Repeal ·and 
and Lifts Ordinance 1941, the Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1942, the saving 
Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1946, the Scaffolding and Lifts 
Ordinance 1953 and the Scaffolding and'Lifts Ordinance (No. 2) 1953 
are repealed. 

. (2) Notwithstanding the repeal effected by the last p+eceding sub
section, section sixteen of the Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 
1941-1953 shall continue in force until section seventeen of th(f Scaffold
ing and Lifts Act commences to apply in the Territory as a law of the 
Territory.2 

( 3) All certificates duly granted under section sixteen of the 
Scajf olding and Lifts Ordinance 1941, or that Ordinance as amended at 
any time, and in force when section seventeen of the Scaffolding and 
Lifts Act commences to apply by force of this Ordinance in the Territory 
as a law of the Territory, shall be deemed to have been duly granted 
under that last-mentioned section and as if that last-mentioned section 
had applied in the Territory as a law of the Territory when they were 
granted. 

( 4) All notices, orders and authorities duly given, all certificates duly 
granted· and all acts and things duly done u.nder or in accordance with 
any of the provisions of an Ordinance repealed by this section (other 
than section sixteen of the Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1941 or that 
Ordinance as amended at any time) or of a law of the State of New 
South Wales which was adopted as a law of the Territory by, or which 
applied as a law of the Territory by virtue of, such an Ordinance and in 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



2 

Interpret
ation 

Ordinance to 
bind Crown 

Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance I 957 

force at the commencement of this Ordinance shall be deemed to be and 
to have been duly given, granted or done under or in accordance with 
the corresponding provisions of the Scaffolding and Lifts Act in its appli
cation in the Territory, or the Scaffolding and Lifts Regulations in their 
application in the Territory, and as if this Ordinance had been in force 
when they were given, granted or done, respectively. 

( 5) A person who, immediately before the commencement of this 
· Ordinancet held office as the Chief Inspector of Scaffolding and Lifts, or 

as an inspector, under the Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1941-1953 
shall hold office as the Chief Inspector of Scaffolding and Lifts or as an 
inspector, as the case may be, under this Ordinance as if he had been 
appointed to that office under this Ordinance. 

4. In this <;)rdinance, unless the contrary intention appears-

" the Scaffolding and Lifts Act" means the Scaffolding and Lifts Act,. 
1912-1948 of the State of New South Wales; 

"the Scaffolding and Lifts Regulations" means the regulations made 
· under the ·Scaffolding and· Lifts Act and published in a sup

plement to the Government Gazette of the State of New South 
Wales on the twenty-fifth day of May, One thousand nine hun
dred and fifty, being those regulations as amended before the 
commencement of this Ordinance. 

5. This Ordinance binds the Crown. 

Apto~ntment 6. The Minister may appoint a Chief Inspector of Scaffolding and 
~!s ~~~r, Lifts an~ such other inspect? rs as ~e considers necessary for the purpose 
&/ ofsecunng observance ofth1s Ordmance and the Regulations. 

Application 
and 
modifica
tions 

PART II-APPLICATION OF THE SCAFFOLDING AND 
LIFTS ACT AND REGULATIONS OF THE STA'.TE OF NEW 

SOUTH WALES 

7. ( I) The provisions· of the Scaffolding and Lifts Act, other thap. . 
sections eleven, twelve, seventeen and seventeen A, apply, as from the 
commencement of this Ordinance, by force of this Ordinance in the Ter
ritory as laws of the Territory, subject to the next succeeding section and 
to the modifications prescribed in Part I of the Schedule to this 
Ordinance. 

(2) The provisions of the Scaffolding and Lifts Regulations, other 
than sub-regulation (I) of regulation sixty-eight, paragraph (b) of regu
lation seventy, regulation seventy-two A, Part XIV, Part XV and the 
First Schedule, apply, as from the commencement of this Ordinance, by 
force of this Ordinance in the Territory as laws of the Territory, subject 
to the modifications prescribed in Part II of the Schedule to this 
Ordinance. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1957 

(3) Sections eleven, twelve, seventeen and seventeen A of the 
Scaffolding and Lifts Act and sub-regulation (I) of regulation sixty
eight, paragraph (b) of regulation seventy, regulation seventy-two A, 
Part XIV and Part XV of, and the First Schedule to, the Scaffolding and 
Lifts Regulations apply, as from a date to be fixed by the Minister by 
notice in the Gazette/ by force of this Ordinance in the Territory as laws 
of the Territory, subject, where appropriate, to th~ next succeeding sec~ 
tion and to the modifications prescribed in Part I or Part II of the Sched
ule to this Ordinance. 

( 4) For the purpose of enabling the provisions of the Scaffolding 
and Lifts Act and the provisions of the Scaffolding and Lifts Regulations 
specified in the last preceding sub~section to be brought into operation 
on the date fixed by the Minister in pursuance of that sub-section, the 
Chief Inspector of Scaffolding and Lifts may, before that date, grant c~r
tificates of competency as a rigger, dogman, scaffolder or crane chaser, 
or certificates as an authorized attendant, in pursuance of those· pro
visions as if those provisions had commenced to apply by force of this 
Ordinance in the Territory as laws of the Territory on the date of com
mencement of this Ordinance, but a certificate of competency, or a certi
ficate, so granted shall not have any force or effect until the date so fixed 
by the Minister in pursuance of that sub-section. 

8. In the application in the Territory of t~e Scaffolding and Lifts In~erpret-
Act- · · auon 

(a) a reference in that Act to the Minister shall be read as a refer
ence to the Minister for the time being administering this 
Ordinance; 

( b) a reference in that Act to regulations made under that Act shall 
be read as ·a reference to the Scaffolding and Lifts Regulations in 
their application in the Territory; and 

( c) a reference in that Act to the Gazette shall be read as a reference 
to the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette. 

PART III-REGULATIONS 

3 

9. ( 1 ) The Minister may make regulations, not inconsistent with this Regulations 

Ordinanc~, prescribing .all matters ~~ich are necess.ary or. convenient ~o ~~~~:;;~0:cl) 
be prescnbed for carrymg out or givrng effect to this Ordinance and, 1n No. 19, 19;?6,s.1 

.particular, for prescribing penalties not exceeding a fine of One hundred 
dollars for offences against the Regulations. 

(2) The Regulations may repeal or amend any of the provisions of 
the Scaffolding and Lifts Regulations in their application in the 
Territory. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



4 

Part I amended 
byNo. 19, 1966, 
s. 7;No. 26, 
l974, s. 2; No. 7, 
1976, s. 3; 
No. 28, 1977, 
ss. 4 and 5; 
No. 17, 1978,s.2 

Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1957 

THE SCHEDULE Section 7 

PART I 

MODIFICATIONS OF THE SCAFFOLDING AND LIFTS ACT, 1912~1948 OF 
THE STATE OF NEW SOUTH WALES IN ITS APPLICATION IN THE 

TERRITORY . 

Item 
No. Provisions modified Modifications 

lA Section 1 
1 Section 2 
2 Sectlon3 

Omit all the words after" 1912-1948,". 
Omit. 
(a) Before the definition of "Authorized attendant", 

insert-

" 'Approved plans and specifications' means plans 
and specifications approved under the Building 
Ordinance 1972"'1974;". 

( aa) Omit the definition of"Chieflnspector", insert-

" 'Chieflnspector' means the person holding office 
as the Chief Inspector of Scaffolding and Lifts 
under the Sca.ff olding and Lifts. Ordinance 
1957-1974, and includes an inspector acting in 
the place of that person;". 

(ab) After the definition of" Contractor", insert-

" 'Cost', in relation to building work, means-

( a) where a contract has been entered into for 
the carrying out of the building work, the 
cost of the work as fixed by the contract; or 

(b) where there is no contract, or the contract 
does not fix the cost of the work, the cost of 
the work as determined in accordance with 
regulation 14 of the Building Regulations, 

but does not include-

( c) the cost of the land on which the building 
work is to be carried out; or 

(d) the cost, other than the cost of installation, 
of boilers, cranes, hoists, lifts or other ma
chinery, being boilers, cranes, hoists, lifts or 
machinery that is not made at the site of the 
building work but is to fo:m part of the 
building; ". 

(b) After the definition of" Crane", insert-
" 'Crane chaser' means a person employed to 

attend and sling loads, and to control the 
movement of loads, handled by a crane where 
the loads are usually at an times in full view of 
the crane driver; · 

'Dogman' means a person directly responsible for 
slinging and controlling the movement ofloads 
by a crane where the loads are not usually at all 
times in full view. of the crane driver;". . 

( c) Omit the definition of"Inspector", insert-
" 'Inspector' means a person holding office as an in~ 

spector under the Scaffolding and Lifts Ord
inance 1957, and includes the Chief Inspec- · 
tor;". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 195 7 

THE SCHEDULE-continued 

PART I-continued 

Item 
No. Provisions modified Modifications 

3 Section4 

4 Section4A 

5 Section4B 

6 Section 5 

7 Section SA 

8 Section6 

( d) After the definition of•• Prescribed", insert-

" 'Rigger' means a person directly in charge of-

( a) the initial work of erecting or placing in pos
ition the members of any type of structure 
other than scaffolding; 

(b) dismantling or demolishing structures other 
than scaffolding; or 

( c) setting up cranes or hoists; 

" 'Scaffolder' means a person engaged in the work 
· of erecting, altering or demolishing scaffolding 
which is so placed that a person or object fall
ing from the scaffolding could fall a distance of 
ten feet or more; ". · 

( e) After the definition of"Supporting structure", insert

" 'the Building Regulations' means the Regulations 
made under the Building· Ordinance 
1972-1974; ". 

( f) At the end of the section, insert-

. Omit. 

Omit. 

Omit. 

Omit. 

Omit. 

, "(2) For the purposes of this Act, each building in a 
pair of semi-detached buildings shall be deemed to 
be a separate b~ilding. 

" ( 3) A reference in this Act to the area of a building 
means-

( a) in the case of a building of one storey-the 
area measured between the outer surfaces of 
the walls at the floor level of that storey; or 

(b) in the case of a building of more than one 
storey-the aggregate of the areas measured 
between the outer surfaces of the walls, at 
the floor level of each storey, 

and includes the area· occupied by a garage, car port, 
verandah o.r other structure, whether or not attached 
to or forming part of the building.•'. 

. . (a) Omit from sub-section (1) "in any district" (first occur
ring). 

(b) Omit from paragraph (b) of sub-section (I) "in any 
district", insert "in the Territory". 

( c) Add at the en~ of sub-section ( 4 )- _ 

"(d) building work, not being building work in re-
. lation to a single private dwelHng-house where 

the cost of the work does not exceed $2,000; or · 

( e) building work in relation to a single private 
dwelling-house where the cost of the work does 
not exceed $40,000. ". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1957 

THE SCHEDULE-continued 

PART I-continued 

Item 
No. Provisions modified · Modifications 

9 Section to 

9A Section 11 
9B PartIII 

10 Section 13 

1 OA Section 14 

11 Section 15 

11 A Section 16 

12 Section 17 

(a) Omit from sub-section ( 1) "in a district". 

(b) Omit from sub-section (2) "twenty pounds", insert 
"Forty dollars". 

Omit" ten pounds", insert "Twenty dollars". 
Add at the end thereof-

" l 2A. (1) The lessee of a building containing a passen
ger lift shall ensure-

( a) that a notice bearing the words 'SMOKING IS 
PROHIBITED', or words to the like effect, is at all 
times displayed in a prominent part of the car of the 
lift; and 

(b) that the notice is clearly visible and readily legible 
from the inside of the car. 

Penalty: $100. 
"(2) A person using a passenger lift in which such a 

notice is displayed shatrnot smoke in the car of the lift. 
P~nalty: $25. 
" ( 3) It is a defence to a prosecution for an offence against 

sub-section ( 1) that the commission of the offence arose out 
of the act of a person other than an employee of the defend
ant, being an act done without the knowledge or consent of 
the defendant." .. 

Omit from paragraph (a) "in any district". 

Omit "ten pounds'', insert "Twenty dollars". 

(a) Omit from sub-sectio~ ( I) "in any district" (twice 
occurring). 

(b) Omit sub-section ( 4 ), insert-

.. ( 4) A pe_rson to whom directions have been given 
under this section may, within twenty~four hours after 
·the directions have. been given to him, appeal against 
the directions to the Minister. -

"( 4A) A person who appeals against the directions of 
an inspector under the last preceding sub-section shall 
give notice of the appeal to the inspector. 

"(4B) The Minister shall hear and determine the 
appeal with all reasonable dispatch and shall, by order 
in writing delivered to the appellant (which order shall 
be final and· conclusive), affirm, vary or rescind the 
directions. • '. · 

(ba) Omit from sub-section (5) "one hundred pounds", 
insert "Two hundred dollars". 

( c) After sub-secti~n ( 5 ), insert~ 
«(6) In this.section, 'the Minister' includes .a person 

. authorized by the Minister to hear appeals under this 
section.". 

Omit" twenty pounds", insert "Forty dollars". 

(a) Omit from sub-section ( 1) "in any district". 

(b) Omit from suh~s.ection(2) "in any district". 

(c)_ Omit sub-sections (5), ( 6), (7), (8) and (9), insert-

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



ScaffoldingandLiftsOrdinance 1957 

THE SCHEDULE-continued 

PART I-continued 

Item 
No. Provisions modified Modifications 

13 Section 17 A 

.. (5) The Chieflnspector may cancel a certificate of 
competency referred to in this section if he is satisfied 
that the holder of the certificate has ceased to be trust
worthy or to be competent to drive a power crane or 
power hoist. · 

"( 6) The Chiefinspector may issue in writing to any 
person a lea:rner's permit authorizing such person to 
act, . in accordance with any conditions endorsed 
thereon or prescribed in relation thereto, as ·a ·power 
crane or power hoist driver. A learner's permit shall re
main in force for such period endorsed thereon as tlie 
Chief Inspector may determine or as may in relation to 
such permits be prescribed. 

Nothing in sub-section (I) or (3) of this section shall 
apply to or in respect of the driving of a power cra9e or 
a pow:er hoist, as the case may be, by the holder of such 
a permit, in accordance with any conditions endorsed 
thereon or. prescribed in relation thereto and for the 
bona fide purpase of such holder learning to be a power 
crane or power hoist driver, as the case may be .. 

The Chief· Inspector . may caQ.cel or suspend a 
l~arner's perm~t issued pursuant to this sub-section and 
a person whose learner's permit has been cancelled or 
is for the time being suspended shall not be deemed to 
be the holder of such a permit.". 

(a) Omit from sub-section ( 1) ",in anydistrict,". 

(b) 0Atitsub-sections(3), (4), (5) and (6),insert-

. "(3) The Chieflnspector may cancel a certificate of 
competency referred to in this section if he is satisfied 
that the holder of the certificate has ceased to be trust
worthy or to be competent to act as a rigger, dogman, 
scaffolder or crane chaser, as the case may be. 

. . 
. "( 4) The Chief Inspector may issue in writing to any 
person a learner's permit authorizing such person to 
act, in accordance with any conditions endorsed 
thereon or prescribed in relation thereto, as a rigger, 
dogman, scaffolder or crane chaser. A learner's permit 
shall remain in force for such period endorsed thereon 
as the Chieflnspector m~y determine or as may in re-
lation to such permits be prescribed. · 

Nothing in sub-section ( 1) of this section shall apply 
to or in respect of any work done by the holder of such a 
permit, . in accordance with any conditions endorsed 
thereon or prescribed in relation thereto and for the 
bona fide purpose of such holder learning to be a rig
&:~· dogman, scaffolder or crane chaser, as the case may · 

The· Chief Inspector may cancel or suspend · a 
learner's permit issued pursuant to this sub-sectmn, and 
a person whose learner's permit has been cancelled or 
is for the ti~e being suspended shall be deemed not to 
be the holder of such a permit.". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1951 

THE SCHEDULE-continued 

PART I-continued 

Item 
No. Provisions modified Modifications 

14 Section 18 (a) Omit from paragraph (a) of sub-section (I) "or" (last 
occurring). · 

(b) Omit from paragraph (b) of sub-section (I) "support-
ing structure; ".insert "supporting structure; or". 

(c) Insert after paragraph (b) of sub-section ( 1 )-
· "(c) so disables any person working on or about 

such crane, hoist, lift, plant, scaffolding, gear, 
building work, excavation work, or compressed 
_air work as tq prevent him from returnin§ to his 
work within 48 hours after the accident,' . 

(d) Omit "compressed air work.,, (last occurring) from 
sub-section ( 1 ), insert "compressed air work, and the 
Chief Inspector shall, in addition, be notified orally of 
an accident to which paragraph (a) applies, as soon as 
possible afterits occurrenee. ". 

15 Section 19 . • (a) Omit paragraph (a), insert-
"(a) driving-

(i) any power crane; 
(ii) any power hoist used in building work or ex-

cavation work; or 
(ill) any other power hoist controlled or operated 

from a platform, seat, cage or cab attached to 
or moving with the hoist unit;''. · 

(b) Omit from paragraph (b) "as defined by section 17 A of 
this Act". 

16 Section21 Omit all the words from and including the words "fifty 
pounds" to the end of the section, insert "One hundred 
dollars". 

17 Section22 (a) Omit sub-section( I). 
(b ). Omit from sub-section (2 )-

.. Without limiting the generality of the powers con-
fei'rea by sub-section one of this section the 
Governor may make regulations", 

insert-
"The power of the Minister under the Scajf olding 

and Lifts Ordinance 1957 to make regulations 
shall be deemed to include power to make regula-
tions, not inconsistent with this Act". 

(c) Omit paragraph ( c) of sub-section (2 ). 
(ca) Omit from sub-section ( 4) "fifty pounds", insert "One 

hundred dollars" . 
(d) . Omit sub-section (5). 

18 First Schedule Omit. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1957 

THE SCHEDULE-continued 

PART II 

MODIFICATIONS OF THE SCAFFOLDING AND LIFTS REGULATIONS OF 
THE STATE OF NEW SOUTH WALES IN THEIR APPLICATION IN THE 

TERRITORY 

Item 
No. Provisions modified Modifications 

1 Regulation I Omit. 

lA , Regulation 2 

2 Regulation 3 

3 Regulation 8 

4 Regulation 10 

5 Regulation 11 

6 Regulation 12 

7 Part III 

8 Regulation 17 

9 Regulation 35 

10 Regulation 69 

11 Regulation 72A 

Omit. 

(a) After the definition of"Bearing pressure", insert-

" 'Chief Inspector• has the same meaning as in the 
Act;". 

(b) After the definition of"ln Commission", insert-
" 'Inspector' has the same meaning as in the Act;". 

( c) Omit the definition of" the Act", insert-

Omit. 

Omit. 

" 'the Act' means the Scaffolding and Lifts Act, 
1912-1948 of the State of New South Wales 
in its application in the Australian Capital 
Territory; 

"'the Explosives Act, 1905' means the Explosives 
Act, 1905 of the State of New South Wales as 
continued in force in the Austra1ian Capital 
Territory; ". 

Omit and insert-

" 11. A person shall not falsely pretend . to be an 
inspector.". 

Omit. 

Omit. 

. Omit from sub-regulation (1) all the words after "Chief 
Inspector". 

Omit from sub-regulation (2) "the promulgation of these 
Regulations", insert" the commencement of the Scajf olding 
and Lifts Ordinance 1957 ". 

. . Omit all the words after "Chlefinspector". 

Omit and substitute-
"72A. ( 1) The fee payable by a person giving notice under 

section 6 of the Act is-
( a) in the case of building work, not being building work 

in relation to a single private dwelling-house-
( i) where the cost of the workexceeds$2,000 but 

does not exceed $100,000-$4 for every 
$1,000, orpartof$1,000, of the cost; or 

(ii) where the cost of the work exceeds 
$100,000-$400 and, for every $4,000, or part 
of$4,000, of the cost, $2; or 

( b) in the case of building work in relation to a single pri
vate dwelling-house-

(i) where the cost of the work exceeds $40,000 
but does not exceed $140,000-20 cents for 

·every $100, or part of$ JOO. of the cost; or 

9 

Part II amended 
by No. S, 1968, 
s. 2; No.26, 
1974,s. 2: No. 7, 
1976,s. J; 
No. 28, l977, s. s 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1957 

THE SCHEDULE-continued 

PART II-continued 

Item 
No. Provisions modified Modifications 

llA Regulation13 

12 Regulation 82 

13 Regulation 83 

14 Regulation 99 

15 Regulation 100 

16 Regulation lO I 

17 Regulation 103 

17 A Regulation 121 

18 Regulation 122 

19 Regulation I 43 

(ii) where the cost of the work exceeds 
$140,000-$400 and, for every $4,000, or part 
of$4,000, of the cost, $2. · 

"(2) Subjectto sub-regulation ( 3 ), only one fee is payable 
in respect of the notification qf all building work comprised 
in a single project. 

" ( 3) Where a second or subsequent notice is given in re
lation to a project, the fee payable shall be calculated on the 
cost of so much: only of the project as was not the subject of 
the prior notice or notic~s. '•. 

Insert after" agents" the words "(including every indepen
dent contractor from time to time engaged in that work)". 

Omit from paragraph (d) of sub-regulation (7) "the 1st 
July, 1950 ", insert "the commencement pf the Scaffolding 
and Lifts Orpinance 1951 ". 

(a) Omit from sub-regulation (13) "the Government 
Analyst", insert" a competent analyst". 

( b) Omit the second paragraph ofsub-regulation ( 14 ), 

(a) Omit from paragraph (a) of sub-regulation ( 4) "After 
the first day of.July, 1950, ", 

( b) ·Omit paragraph (b) of sub-regulation ( 4), insert-

" ( b) The Medical Officer's report shall be 
preserved and produced to an Inspector upon 
demand.". · 

(c) Omit from sub-regulation (23) "in or to the effect of 
Form 11 set forth in the Second Schedule to these 
Regulations••. 

(a) Omit from paragraph (a) of sub-regulation (:4) "After 
the:firstdayofJuly, 1950,". 

(b) Omit paragraph (b) of sub-regulation ( 4), insert

"(b) The Medical Officer's report shall be 
preserved and produced to an Inspector upon 
demand.". 

(a) Omit from paragraph (a) of sub-regulation ( 4) "After 
the firstdayofJuly, 1950,". 

( b) Omit paragraph {b) of sub-regulation ( 4), insert-

" ( b) The Medical Officer's report shall be 
preserved and produced to an Inspector upon 
demand.''. · 

After "Department" in sub-regulation (4), insert "of the 
State ofNewSouth Wales''. 

Omit from paragraph (a} of sub-regulation {2) "twenty" 
(wherever occurring), insert "ten". 

Omit sub-regulations ( 14) and ( 15 ). 

(a) Omit from paragraph ( b) of sub-regulation (9) "After 
JstJuly, 1950,". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1957 

THE SCHEDULE-continued 

PART II-continued 

Item 
No. Provisions modified Modifications 

· 20 Regulation 159 

21 Regulation 1 ?O 

22 Regulation 161 

23 Regulation 162 

24 Regulation 163 

24AARegulation 164 
24A First Schedule 

(b) Omit from paragraph (c) of sub-regulation (9) "a test 
certificate correct in all particulars in Form 14 con
tained in the second schedule to these Regulations'', 
insert "the test certificate correct in all particulars" .. 

( aa) Insert after sub-regulation (I)-
"( lA) Every application for a learner's permit shall 

be accompanied by the fee prescribed by the First 
Schedule.". · 

(ab) Omitsub-regulation(2). 
(a) Omit sub-regulations (8) and (9). 

(b) Omit from sub-regulation (10) "Where the Minister 
has cancelled or suspended", insert "Where the Chief 
Inspector has cancelled". 

(ba) Omit from sub-regulation ( 10) "twenty poqnds", 
substitute" 40 dollars". 

' 
(c) Omit the la.st paragraph of sub-regulation( 14). 
(d) Omitsub-regulation (15). 

Omit from sub-regulation (I) all words after "Chief 
Inspector". 

(a} Omit from sub-regulation (1) "in or to the effect of 
Form 23 set forth in the Second Schedule to these · 
Regulations"t insert "made in writing to the Chief 
Inspector". 

(b) Omit from sub-regulation (2) "in or to the effect of 
Form 23 set forth in the Second Schedule to these 
Regulations", insert "made in writing to the Chief 
Inspector". 

(c) Omit from sub-regulation (3) "in or to the effect of 
Form 23 ·set forth in the Second Schedule to these 
Regulations", insert "made in writing to the Chief 
Inspector". 

( d) Omit from sub-regulation ( 4) "in or to the effect of 
Form 23 set forth in the Second Schedule to these 
Regulations", insert "made in writing to the Chief 
Inspector''. 

(a) Omit from sub-regulation (1) all words after "Chief 
Inspector". 

(b) Omit from sub-regulation (2) all words after "Chief 
Inspector". 

( c) Omit sub-regulation ( 3 ). 

Omit and insert-
" 163. A fee payable under these Regulations may be sued · 

for and recovered as a debt due to the Commonwealth in 
any court of competent jurisdiction.". 

Omit"£50 '',substitute "$100 ", 
(a) Insert the following paragraph before paragraph B: 

"A.-Fee to be paid by an applicant for a learner's 
permit for either a power crane or a power hoist or to 
act as a rigger, dogman, scaffolder or crane chaser, as 
the case may be . . . . . . . . . . $1.00 u. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Scaffolding and Lifts Ordinance 1957 

THE SCHEDULE-continued 

PART II-continued 

Item 
No. Provisions modified Modifications 

(b) Omit all paragraphs after paragraph A and substitute 
the following paragraphs: · 

"B.-Fee to be paid for issue of any 
certificate . . . . . . . . . . . . $10.00 

"C.-Fees to he paid forissue of copies 
of any certificate-

( i) fee to be paid for issue of first 
copy . . . . . . . . . $3.00 

(ii) fee to be paid for issue of each 
subsequent copy . . . . . $5.00. ". 

25 Second Schedule . . Omit 

NOTES 

I. The Scajf olding and Lifts Ordinance 19 57 (a) as shown in this reprint comprises 
Ordinance No. 8, 1957 as amended by the other Ordinances specified in the fol
lowing table: 

Date of 
Number notification Date of 

Ordinance and year in Gazette commencement 

Scfraolding and Lifts No. 8, 1957 
rdinance 1957 

19Sept·l957 19Sept1957 

Ordinances Revision (Decimal No. 19, 1966 23Dec 1966 23Dec 1966 
Currency) Ordinance 1966 

Scaff aiding and Lifts No. 5, 1968 21Mar1968 21 Marl968 
Ordinance t 968 

Scaffolding af!d Lifts No.26, 1974 30 July 1974 30July1974 
Ordinance 1974 

Scfraoldfng and Lifts No. 7, 1976 24Feb 1976 24Feb 1976 
rdinance 1976 

Scaffolding and Lifts . 
(Amendment) Ordinance 

No.28, 1977 1July1977 l July 1977 

1977 
Scaffolding and Lifts No.17, 1978 

(Amendment) Ordinance 
4July1978 . 4July 1978 

1978 

(a) This citation is provided for by the Amendments Incorporation Ordinance 1929 and the 
Ordinances Citaiiim Ordinance 1916. · 

2.-S. 3 (2)-Section 17 of the Scaffolding and Lifts Act, 1912-1948 commenced to 
apply in the Territory as a law of th~ Territory on 1 September 1959 (see Gazette 
1959, p. 2413). 

3.-S. 7 (3)-The date fixed was I September 1959(see Gazette 1959, p. 2413). 

Printed by Authority by the Commonwealth Government Printer 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




