260

AUSTRALIAN CAPITAL TERRITORY
Regulations 1980 No. 3

Regulations to repeal certain Regulations and to revise certain Regulations in

force under the Ordinances of the Australian Capital Territory'

I, PETER DREW DURACK, the Atlorney-General of the Commonwealth of
Australia, as Attorney-General and acting for and on behalf of the Minister of
Siate for the Capital Territory, the Minister of State for Education, the Minis-
ter of State for Health and the Minister of State for Business and Consumer
AfTairs, hereby make, under each Ordinance specified in the Schedule, the
Regulation or the Regulations set out in that Schedule immediately following

the short titie of that Ordinance.

Dated this sixteenth day of March 1980.

P. DURACK
Atlorney-General

SCHEDULE'

ADOPTION OF CHILDREN ORDINANCE 1965

The Adoption of Children Regulations are amended as set out in the fol-

lowing table:

Provision Amendment

Regulation 3 . . .« . . . . Repeatl

Sub-repulation7(1) . . . . . Omit "Filly dolbars”, substitule “$50"

Regulution 14 . . . . . . . Omit "Filty doHurs”, substitute “$507

Second Schedule . . . . . . Omit "Papua New Guinea......Registrar-General™

AGENTS ORDINANCE 1968

The Agents Regulations are amended as set out in the following table:
Provision Amendment

Regulation 2 Lo o oo Omit
Omit ™

“Ten dollars”. substitute “$10™
Sub-regulation 3¢y . . . . . Omt”
: : Omit ™

Omit ™

Omul

Sub-regulation3(2) . . . . . Omil

Twenty dollars™ (wherever oceurring). substitute $207
two™ (wherever oceurring), substitute 2"

Twenly dollars™ (wherever occurring), substitute “$207
Two™ (wherever occurring), substitute 2"
Ten dollars™, substitute “$10™

“Thirty dollaes™ {wherever oceurring), substitute “$307
Omit*
Omit

two™ (wherever occurring), substitute »2™
Fifteen dollars™, substitute 815"

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



1980 No. 3 261

SCHEDULE—continued

Provision Amendment

Sub-regulation4 (1) . . . . . Omit “Ten dollars™, substitute “§10”
Sub-regutatton4 (2 . . . . . Omit "Fifteen dollars™, substitute *$157
Regulation> . . . . . . . Omit"“Twenty-five”, substitute *25”
Regufation6 . . . . . . . Repeal

APIARIES ORDINANCE 1928

The Apiaries Regulations are amended as set out in the following table:
Provisicn Amendment

TheSchedule . . . . . . . Omit from Form A “Department of the [nterior™, substitute “De-
pariment of the Capital Territory™
Omit from Form B “the Interior™, substitute “the Capital Territory”
Omit from Form C “Department of the Interior”, substitute “'De-
partment of the Capital Territory”

BUILDING AND SERVICES ORDINANCE 1924

Regulations 1946 No. 3 (being the Repeal of Electricty Restriction Regu-
lations)} are repealed.

Regulations 1948 No. 3 (being the Repeal of Electricity Restriction Regu-
lations) are repealed.

Regulations 1949 No. 8 (being the Repeal of Electricity Restriction Regu-
lations) are repealed.

Regulations 1954 No. | (being the Repeal of Electricity Restriction Regu-
lations) are repealed.

Regulations 1976 No. 2 (being the Repeal of the Canberra and Jervis Bay
Electric Supply Regulations) are repealed.

CANBERRA COMMERCIAL DEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY
ORDINANCE 1974

Regulations 1975 No. 27 (being the Canberra Commercial Development
Authority Regulations) are repealed.
CANBERRA RETAIL MARKET TRUST ORDINANCE 1971
Regulations 1972 No. 5 and Regulations 1974 No. 26 (being the Canberra

Retail Market Trust Regulations) are repealed.

CANBERRA THEATRE TRUST ORDINANCE 1965

The Canberra Theatre Centre By-Laws are amended as set out in the fol-
lowing table:

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



262

Provision
By-law 2

By-law 3 .
By-law4 . . .
By-luw 8 (2) (b}
By-law |} (1)
By-luw 1} (2)
By-law 13 (2)

By-luw 17

1980 No. 3

SCHEDULE - continued

Amendment

Omit “Liquor Ordinance 1929 1966 from Lhe definition of
“liquor™, substitute " Liguor Ordinance 19757

Omit “thirty”, substitute *30™

Omit "len™ {wherever occurring), substitute " 10”

Omit “eighteen™ {(wherever occurring), substitute 18"

Omit “eighteen™, substitute 18"

Crmit “'ten”, substitule 0™

Omit “three™, substitule *3"

Omit “seven™, substitute * 7

Omit “Dogs Registration Ordinance 1926-1967", substitute “Dog
Control Ordinance 19757

Omit “Forly dollars™, substitute “$40"

CARELESS USE OF FIRE ORDINANCE 1936

The Careless Use of Fire Regulations are amended as set out in the follow-

ing table:
Provision

Regulatton 2 .
Regulation 3 .o
Sub-regulation 4 (2}
Sub-regulation 5 (1)

Amendment

Omit “Ten pounds™, substitute “$20"

Omit “Ten pounds™, substitute “$20™

Omit “Twenty pounds™, substitute “*$40™

Omit “Two pounds” and “Twenty pounds”, substitute “$4" and
“$40" respectively

CEMETERIES ORDINANCE 1933

The Canberra Public Cemeteries Regulations are amended as set out in the

following table:
Provision

Sub-regulation 3 (1)
Sub-regulation 4 {2)
Sub-regulation 10 (2)
Sub-repulation 24 (1)
Sub-regulation 24 (2)
Sub-regulation 24 (3)
Paragraph 30 (b)

Regulation 35
Schedule 2

Amendment

Omit “three”, substitute *3™

Omit "two", substitute 2"

Omit “Commonwealth”, substitute “Australian"
Omit “1wo™, substitute 2

Omit “two™ and “ten™, substitute “2" and **10” respectively
Crmat “'zix™, substilute 6™

Omit “the Cemetery ™, substitule “a public cemetery™
Omat “six inches™, substitute *'1 50 millimetres”

Omit “Twenty dollars”™, substitute “$20"

ltem 4 (a}: Omit “four”, substitute 4™

ltem 4 (b): Omit “lour™, substitute “4™

[tem 5: Omit “Eight dollars™, substitute “$8"

CHILD WELFARE ORDINANCE 1957

The Child Welfare Regulations are amended as set out in the following

table:

Provision
Regulation 2 .o
Sub-regulation § (2)

Paragraph 17 {b)

Sub-regulation 18 (1)
Sub-regulation 18 (3)
Regulalion 19 .

Amendment

Repeal

Omit "Canberra Community Hospital”, substitute “Royal Canberra
Hospital, Woden Valley Hospital or Calvary Hospital™

Omit “five”, substitute *5™

Omil “three™, substitute 3"

Omil “seven ™, substitute "7

Omil "Four pounds per week ™, substitute 58 per week”

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Provision

Paragraph 22 (d)
Regulation 24
Regulation 25

1980 No. 3 263

SCHEDULE—continued

Amendment
Omit “six”, substitute 67

Repeal
Omit “Ten pounds”, substitute “$20"

CITY AREA LEASES ORDINANCE 1936

The City Area Leases Regulations are amended as set out in the following

table:
Provision
Regulation 8

Sub-regulation 10 (1) i

Sub-regulation 10 (2)

The Schedule

Amendment

Omit “thirty”, substitute “30"

Omit “Department of the Interior, Canberra™, substitute "Depart-
ment of the Capital Territory, Canberra™

Omit “two™, substitute “2”

Omit “Department of the Interior™, substitute “Department of the
Capital Territory”

Omit “Five pounds per centum”, substitute “*5%"

Clause 1 (b): Omt “Eight pounds petr centum (8%) per annum”,
substitute “8%"

Clause 1 (c): Omit “pounds”, substitute “$”

Clause 3 (a) (1): Omit “twelve”, substitute *12”

Clause 3 (a) (iii): Omit “two”, substitute “2"

Clause 3 (g): Omit “two”, substitute 2"

COMPANIES ORDINANCE 1962

The Companies Regulations are amended as set out in the following table:

Provision
Regulation 2 .
Sub-regulation 9 {7)
Sub-regulation 9 (8)
Regulation 10 .

Sub-paragraph 12 (1} (j) (i}
Sub-paragraph 12 (1} (j) u)

Paragraph 13 (a)

Sub-regulation 26 (1)
Sub-regulation 27 (1)
Sub-regulation 27 (2)

Sub-regulation 38 (1)
Sub-regulation 38 (2)

Sub-regutation 44 (1)
Regulation 45
Regulation 73
Regulation 75
Second Schedule

Amendment

Repeal

Omit “three”, substitute **3"

Omit “three”, substitute **3"

Omit “Ten thousand dollars” (wherever occurring), substitute
“$10,000™

Omit “six”, substitute 6™

Omit “two”, substitute “2”

Omit “two”, substitute 2"

Omit “seven’’ (wherever occurring), substitute “7"

Omit “two" (wherever occurring), substitute 2

Omit “seven” (wherever occurring) and “twenty-one”, substitute
*7" and “'21" respectively

Omit “two™, substitute *2"

Omit “seven”™ and ‘“twenty-one’, substitute “7” and "21"
respectively

Omit “seven’”, substitute *7”

Omit “two™, substitute “2"

Omit “five per centum”, substitute *5%"

Omit “Forty dollars”, substitute “$40”

Omit from Form 49 “Companies (Unclaimed Assets and Moneys}
Ordinance 1950-1962", substitute “Unclaimed Moneys Ordinance
1950

Omit from Form 84 “Section 348 (1), substitute "Section 347 (1)

Omit from Form 86 “Companies {Unclaimed Assets and Moneys)
Ordinance 1950-1962", substitute “Unclaimed Moneys Ordinance
1950™

The Companies Auditors Board Regulations are amended by omitting from
the Notice Requiring a Person to give Evidence in the Schedule “Fifty pounds”

and substituting “$100”,

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



264 1980 No. 3
SCHEDULE continued

CONSUMER AFFAIRS ORDINANCE 1973

Regulations 1973 No. 6 and Regulations 1974 No. 27 (being the Consumer
Affairs Regulations) are repealed.

CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES ORDINANCE 1939

The Co-operative Societies Regulations are amended as set out in the fol-
lowing table:
Provision Amendment
Schedule .« .« .« . . . Omitlrom Form A “two", substitute 2"
Omil from Form A “seven”™ {wherever occurring), substitute *7"
Omit from Form A “twenty-one™’, substitute " 18"
Omit from Form B “seven”, substitute 77
Form B is umended by inserting “and subject 1o the penalties pro-
vided by that Act for the making of false statementls in statulory
declarations” after *1959,”
Omit from Form C “twenty-one™, substitute 18"

DENTISTS REGISTRATION ORDINANCE 1931

The Dental Regulations are amended as set out in the following table:

Provision Amendment
Sub-regulstion 3¢4) . . . . Omil “seven”, substitute "7
Regulation § oo oo After 230 (1), insert Yol the Ordinance™

EDUCATION ORDINANCE 1937

Regulations 1964 No. | (being the Repeal of the Education Regulations)
are repealed.

ELECTRICITY ORDINANCE 1971
The Electricity Regulations are amended as set out in the following table:

Provision Amendment

Regulation 2 .o o o oo OmitFive dollars”, substitute T$57

Regulation 2 S o o oo Omit " Twodollars™, substilute Y527

Repulation 4 o Omit"Twodollars™, substitute 82

I'he Schedule oo Omittiwo™ (wherever occurring) ., substitute 27

Omit “five”, substitute °57

HEALTH COMMISSION ORDINANCE 1975

The Health Commission Regulations are amended as set out in the follow-

ing table:

Provision Amendment

Paragraph 7 (b) oo o Omit "Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman®

Sub-regulation8{2y . . . . . Omit "Commissioner”, substitute *Chairman"

Sub-regulation8(4) . . . . . Omit “"Commissioner™ (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairman™

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



1980 No. 3 _ 265

SCHEDULE —continued
The Health Commission (Charges) Regulations are amended as set out in

the following table:

Provision Amendment

Regulation 2 . . . . . . . Omit 15 March 1979" from the definition of “standard medical
benefits table™, substitute 1 November 1979"

Paragraph 6 (1) (a) . . . . . Omil“seven", subsiitute “7"

Paragraph 68 (1) (a) . . . . Omit“percent”, substitute “%"

Paragraph$ (2){a) . . . . . Omit “1974", substitute “1947"

INDUSTRIAL BOARD ORDINANCE 1936

Industrial Board Regulations made on 22 July 1936 and notified in the
Gazetre on 23 July 1936 are repealed.

Industrial Board Regulations made on 11 November 1936 and notified in
the Gazette on 19 November 1936 are repealed.

Industrial Board Regulations made on 8 April 1938 and notified in the
Gazetre on 13 April 1938 are repealed.

Regulations 1940 No. 1 (being an Amendment of the Industrial Board
Regulations) are repealed.

Industrial Board Election Regulations made on 15 April 1936 and notified
in the Gazette on 23 April 1936 are repealed.

Industrial Board Election Regulations made on 14 October 1936 and
notified in the Gazette on 22 October 1936 are repealed.

Industrial Board Election Regulations made on 13 December 1938 and
notified in the Gazerie on 22 December 1938 are repealed.

Regulations 1941 No. 2 (being an Amendment of the Industrial Board Elec-
tion Regulations) are repealed.

INSTRUMENTS ORDINANCE 1933

The Instruments Regulations are amended by omitting from regulation 2
“one shilling™ and substituting *“10 cents™.

JURIES ORDINANCE 19%67

The Juries Fees Regulations are amended as set out in the following table:
Provision Amendment

Schedule .« « . . . . . Omi from paragraph (1), “three” and “four” (wherever occurring},

substitute “3” and “4” respectively

Omit from paragraph (2) “three” and “four” (wherever occurring),
substitute 3" and "4” respectively

Omit from paragraph (3) "three miles” (twice occurring}, substitute
"5 kilometres”

Omit from paragraph (3) “25 cents for each mile”, substitute “16
cents for each kilometre™

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



266

1980 No. 3

SCHEDULE—continued

MACHINERY ORDINANCE 1949

The Boilers and Pressure Vessels Regulations are amended as set out in the

following table:
Provision

Regulation 3 .
Paragraph 6 {1) (a)

Paragraph & (1) (¢}
Paragraph 7 (1) (a)
Paragraph 7 (1} (c)
Paragraph 7 (2) (b)
Regulation 10 A
Sub-regulation 21 (3)
Sub-regulation 25 (1)
Sub-regulation 25 (2)
Paragraph 27 (a)

Regulation 30 .
Paragraph 39 (1) (d) -
Sub-paragraph 39 (1) (e) (ii)

Sub-paragraph 39 (1) (e) (iii)

Paragraph 39 (1) (e)
Sub-regulation 41 (1)
Sub-regulation 43 (2)
Paragraph 44 (1)

Paragraph 49 (c)
Regulation 50
Heading

Amendment

Repeal

Omit “Commonwealth Railways Commissioner”, substitute “Aus-
tralian National Railways Commission”

Omit “three gallons”, substitute “13.63 litres™

Omit “two”, substitute “2"

Omit “two”, substitute *2"

Omit “two", substitute “2"

Omit “two”, substitute “2"

Omit “three”, substitute 3"

Omit “twelve”, substitute 12"

Omit “three”, substitute *3™

Omit “fourteen™, substitute 14"

Omit “fourteen”, substitute “*14"

Omit “eighteen”, substitute “18”

Omit “three hundred” and “six™, substitute 300" and "6 respect-
vely

Omit “three hundred” and “six”, substitute “300™ and "6 respect-
ively

Omit “Ten shillings™, substitute “$1"

Omit “fourteen™, substitute 14"

Omit “seven”, substitute *7"

Omit “forty-¢ight™ and “twenty-four™, substitute “48" and “24" re-
spectively

Omit “sixteen”, substitute “16"

Omit “Fifty pounds”, substitute “$100"

Omit the heading “THE SCHEDULES™

The Inspection of Machinery Regulations are amended as set out in the fol-

lowing table:
Provision
Sub-regulation 7 (2)
Regulation 13 ..
Paragraph 15 (20) (a)
Paragraph 15 (20) (b)
Regulation 16
Regulation 17 R
Sub-regulation 19 (2)
Regulation 20
Regulation 22
Regulation 25

Amendment

Omit “six”, substitute 6"

Omit “Fifty pounds™, substitute “5$100™
Omit “fifteen™, substitute *15™

Omit “eighteen™, substitute *“18"

Omit “Fifty pounds”, substitute “$100™
Omit “Fifty pounds”, substitute “$100™
Omit “forty-eight”, substitute “48"

Omit “Twenty-four™, substitute “24™
Omit *“Fifty pounds™, substitute *$100™
Omit “Twenty pounds”, substitute “$40"

MAINTENANCE ORDINANCE 1968

The Maintenance Regulations are amended by omitting from Form 2 in the
First Schedule “67" and substituting “'65™.

MEAT ORDINANCE 1931

The Meat Regulations are amended as set out in the following table:

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Provision

Regulation 4
Regulation 3 .
Sub-regulation 5 (1)
Sub-regulation 5 (4)
Sub-regulation § {5)
Sub-regulation 6 (2)
Regulation 7 .
Sub-regulation 9 (2)
Regulation 204 .
The Schedule

1980 No. 3 267

SCHEDULE —continued

Amendment

Omit “Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman™

Omit “Commissioner”” (wherever occurring). substitute “Chairman™

Omit “Four dollars”, substitute “$4™

Omit "Four dollars™, substitute “'$4"

Omit “Four dollars”, substitute “$4"

Omit “eightzen™, substitute *18”

Omit “twenty-four”, substitute “24™

Omit “Commissioner”, substitute *Chairman™

Omil “Commissioner”™ (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairman™

Omit from Forms A and B “Commissioner” (wherever occurring),
substitute “Chairman™

Omit from Form B “One thousand nine hundred and thirty"”, substi-
tute “t9™

MEDICAL PRACTITIONERS REGISTRATION ORDINANCE 1930

The Medical Practitioners Registration Regulations are amended as set out
in the following table:

Provision

Sub-regulation 3 (4)
Regulation &

Amendment

Omit “seven”, substitute “7”
Omit “Two dollars ten cents™, substitute *$2.10™

MILK AUTHORITY ORDINANCE 1971

Regulation 10 of the Milk Authority Regulations is repealed.

MONEY LENDERS ORDINANCE 1936
The Money Lenders Regulations made on 24 April 1936 and notified in the
Gazette on 30 April 1936 are repealed.
MOTOR TRAFFIC ORDINANCE 1936

The Motor Vehicle (Third Party Insurance) Regulations are amended as
set out in the following table:

Provision

Sub-regulation 8 {2)
Regulation @

Amendment

Omit “One hundred dotlars”, substitute “$100™
Omit "Twenty-five™, substitule *25™

Paragraph 11 (a) . Omit “Canberra Communily Hospital (Charges) Regulations”, sub-
stitute *Health Commission (Charges) Regulations™

Sub-regulation 15 (2) Qmit “Forly dollars”™, substitute “$40™

Paragraph 16 (1)} (b) .. . . Omit “Seventy-five” and “twelve”, substitute 75" and 12"
respectively

Sub-regulation 16 (3) .« . . Omit “Sevenly-five” and "“iwelve”, substitute 75" and “12"
respectively

Regulation 17 . . .+« . Omil “Twenty-five”, substitute “25"

Sub-paragraph 18 (a} (l) E
Sub-paragraph 18 {a) (i)

Omil *filteen”, substitute “13”
Omil “'One dollar fifty cents™ and “fifteen™, substitute “$1.50" and
15" respectively

Sub-paragraph 18 {(b) (i} . . . Omit "One dollar and seventy-five cents™ and "fifteen”, substitule
“$1.75" and "1 5" respectively
Sub-paragraph 18 (b) (i . . . Omt “Two dollars and twenty-five cents™ and “fifteen™, substitute

“$2.25"and “15" respectively

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



268 1980 No. 3
SCHEDULE—continued

PHARMACY ORDINANCE 1931
The Pharmacy Regulations are amended as set out in the following table:

Provision Amendment
Sub-regulation3 (4) . . . . . Omil “seven”, substitute “7™
Sub-regulation3{1) . . . . . Omit “Two dollars ten cents”™, substitute “3$2.10™

POISONS AND DANGEROUS DRUGS ORDINANCE 1933

The Poisons Regulations are amended by omitting the headings
“PART I PRELIMINARY"” and “PART V—MISCELLANEOUS”,

POKER MACHINE CONTROL ORDINANCE 1975

The Poker Machine Regulations are amended as set out in the following
table:

Provision Amendment
Regulation? . . . . . . . Repeal
Schedulel . . . . . . . . Omit from subclause 2 {4) “two”, substitute “2"

POLICE ORDINANCE 1927

Police Regulations (being Regulations under the Police Ordinance 1927)
made on 10 March 1930 and notified in the Gazette on 13 March 1930 are
repealed.

Police Regulations made on 7 May 1930 and notified in the Gazette on 9
May 1930 are repealed.

Police Regulations made on 10 September 1934 and notified in the Gazette
on 20 September 1934 are repealed.

Police Regulations made on 31 January 1936 and notified in the Gazette on
13 February 1936 are repealed.

Police Regulations made on 28 May 1936 and notified in the Gazette on 4
June 1936 are repealed.

Regulations 1940 Nos. 3 and 7; 1942 No. 1; 1943 No. 2; 1950 No. 9; 1954
No. 2; 1958 No. 3; 1959 No. 21; 1962 No. 2; 1964 No. 4; 1972 No. 12; 1975 No. 7
and 1976 No. 1 (being the Police Regulations) are repealed.

POUNDS ORDINANCE 1928
The Pounds Regulations are amended as set out in the following table:

Provision Amendment

Regulatien12 . . . . . . . Omit “six™, substitute “6"

Regulation19 . . . . . . . Omit “Department of the Interior”, substitute “Department of the
Capital Territory™

Regulation29 . . . . . . . Omit “twenty-four™, substitute “24™

Regulation3¢ . . . . . . . Omit “fifteen”’, substitute 15"

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



1980 No. 3 269

SCHEDULE—continued
PUBLIC HEALTH ORDINANCE 1928

The Public Health (Barbers’ Shops) Regulations are amended as set out in

the following table:

Provision

Regulation 3 .
Sub-regulation 6 (1)
Sub-regulation 6 (2)
Sub-regulation 6 {3}
Paragraph B (¢) .
Sub-regulation 17 (3)

Sub-regulation 17 (5)

Sub-regulation 17 {7)

Paragraph 18 (a)
Paragraph [ 8 (b)
Sub-regulation 20 (1)
Sub-regulation 20 (2)
The Schedule

Amendment

Repeal

Omit “Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman”™

Omit "Commissioner™, substitute “‘Chairman™

Omit “Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman™

Omit “two”, substitute *2”’

Omit “0.2 per cent™, “thirty per cent” and “two per cent”, subslitute
*0.2%", " 30%" and “2%" respectively

Omit “three”, substitute 3"

Omit 0.2 per cent”, “thirty per cent” and “two per cent”, substilute
“0.2%, *30%" and 2% respectively

Omit "ten per cent.”, substitute “10%"

Omit “thirty”, substitute *30"

Omil "three” { wherever occurring), substitute 3"

Omit “thirty per cent.”, substitute “30%™

Omit “"two per cent™, substitute “2%"

Omit “five™, substitute 5™

Omit “ten”, substitute “10"

Omit “three”, substitute *3"

Omit “three”, substitute 3"

Omil from Forms A and B “Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman™

The Public Health (Boarding-houses) Regulations are amended as set out

in the following table:

Provision
Sub-regulation 3 (1)
Sub-regulation 5 (2)
Sub-regulation 5 (3)
Regulation 6 .
Sub-regulation 8 (2)
Sub-regulation 8 (3)
Regulation 10 .
Regulation 16

The Schedule

Amendment

Omit “*Commissioner ", substitute “Chairman"
Omit “Commuissioner ™, substitute “Chairman™
Omit “Commissicner’, substitute “*Chairman”
Omit “Commissioner”, substitute “Chairman”
Omit “Commissioner”, substitute “Chairman”
Omit “Commissioner”, substitute “Chairman”
Omit “Commissioner'’, substitute “Chairman™
Omit “Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman™
Omit from Form A “seven™, substitute 7"
Omit from Form B “Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman™
Omit from Form B “1937, substitute 19"
Omit from Form B “seven”, substitute *7”

The Public Health (Dairy) Regulations are amended as set out in the

following table:

Provision
Regulation 4

Sub-regulation 6 (7)

Amendment

Omit “centum” from the definition of “cream™, substitute “cent”

Omit “one part per centun™ from the definition of “cream mixlure”,
substitute “‘one part per cent™

Omit “centum” (1wice occurring) from the definition of “light
cream”, substitute “cent™

Omit “centum™ (1wice occurring) from the definition of "reduced
cream’”, substitute “cent”

Omit “issued by the Department™ from the definition of “tubercu-
lin™, substitute “supplied by the Commonwealth Serum Labora-
tories”

Omit “Five dollars™ (wherever occurring), substitute "$5™

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



270

Provision

Paragraph 8 (2) (2)
Sub-regulation 8 (3)
Sub-regulation 10 (2)

Sub-regulation 19 (1}
Sub-regulation 19 (5)
Sub-regulation 19 (8)
Sub-regulation 20 (2)
Sub-regulation 21 (5)

Sub-paragraph 29 (1) (a) (||).

Regulation 33
Sub-reguiation 37 (3)

Sub-regulation 37 (6)

Sub-paragraph 44 (d) (v)
Sub-regulation 444 (2)
Paragraph 444 (2) (a)
Paragraph 48A (e) .
Sub-paragraph 50 (d) (1)

Regulation 59a .
Sub-regulation 82 (1)

Sub-regulation 82 (2)

Sub-regulation 83 (1)
Paragraph 82 (2) (a)

Regulation 90 .
Paragraph 93 (2} (a)
Paragraph 103 (b)

1980 No. 3

SCHEDULE —continued

Amendment

Omit “fourteen™, substitute 14"

Omit “lourteen™, substitute 14"

Omit “thirty™, substitute 30"

Omit “five™, substitute “5"

Omit “fourteen™ (wherever occurring), substitute “14™

Omil “Five dollars™, substitute “$5™

Omit “fourteen”, substitute **14”

Omit “thirty™, substitute 30"

Omit “fifty per centum”, substitute " 50%"

Omit “one hundred and twenty”, substitute 1207

Omit “three™, substitute ™3

Omit “six”, substitute **6™

Omit “five”, substitute *5”

Omit “The last three preceding sub-regulations™, substitute “Sub-
regulations (3), (4) and (5)"

Omit “three”, substitute “3”

Omit “three”, substitute *3"

Omit “-section”, substitute ““-regulation™

Omit “thirty”, substitute *30™

Omit “thirty”, substitute 30"

Omit "five”, substitute “5"

Omit “{1)”

Omit “six”, substitute “6”

Omut “five”, substitute “5"

Omit “six”, substitute “6"

Omit “five”, substitute “5"

Omit “three”, substitute “3™

Omit “seven™, substitute "7

Omit “fourteen™, substitute 14”7

Omit “twenty-four™, substitute 24"

Omit “two”, substitute “2”

Omit “sixteen”, substitute 16"

The Public Health (Eating Houses) Regulations are amended as set out in

the following table:
Provision

Regulation 2 .o
Sub-regulation 4 (1)
Sub-regulation 4 (2)
Regulation 5 ..
Sub-regulation 9 {2)
The Schedule

Amendment

Omit “Commissioner™, substitute *"Chairman™

Omit “Coemmissioner™, substitute “*Chairman™

Omit “Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman™

Omit “Commissioner”, substitute **Chairman”

Omit “continuing™, substitute “contlaining”™

Omit from Farms A and B “Commissioner”, substitute “Chairman™

The Public Heaith (General Sanitation) Regulations are amended by omit-

ting “Commissioner”

(wherever occurring) from each of the following pro-

visions and substituting “Chairman’:

Regulations 4, 9, 17, 18; sub-regulation 19 (3); regulations 24, 26; sub-regulations 27 (1), 27 (3). 27 (4),
27(5).28(1),28 (2), 28 (3), 28 (5): regulation 32.

The Public Health (Infectious and Notifiable Diseases) Regulations are
amended as set out in the following table:

Provision

Regulation 10 .
Sub-regulation 12 [2)
Regulation 15
Regulation 16

Regulation 17

Amendment

Omit “Commissioner™ (twice occurring), substitute “Chairman™

Omit "Commissioner”, substitute “Chairman™

Omit “head teacher™, substitute “principal teacher™

Omit “head teacher™ {wherever occurring), substitute “principal
teacher™

Omit “Commissioner” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairman™

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



1980 No. 3 271

SCHEDULE —continued

The Public Health {Meat) Regulations are amended as set out in the fol-

lowing table:
Proviston
Heading
Regulation 2

Paragraph 3 (¢)
Regulation 4
Reguiation 6 N
Sub-regulation 19 (2)

Sub-regulation 19 (&)
Sub-regulation 20 (1)
Schedule

Amendment

Omit the Heading “PART 1—PRELIMINARY™

Omit "Public Health (Infectious Diseases) Regulations™ [rom the
definition of “Infectious diseases”, substitute “Public Health (In-
fectious and Notifiable Diseases) Regulations™

Omit “carcasses” from the definition of “Refuse”, substitute “car-
cases™

Omit “carcasses”, substitute “carcases’

Omit “"Commissioner™ (wherever occurring), substitute "Chairman™

Omit “*Commissioner™ (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairman™

Omit “seventy-five”, substitute “75™

Omit “six parts per centum”, substitute **6 parts per cent”

Omit “Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman™

Omit “Commissioner”, substitute “Chairman™

After regulation 24 insert the heading “SCHEDULE™

Omit from Forms A, B, C and D “Commissioner™ (wherever occur-
ring), substitute “Chairman™

The Public Health (Medical and Dental Inspection of School Children)
Regulations are amended as set out in the following table:

Pravision
Regulation 2

Sub-regulation 3 (2)
Sub-regulation 4 (2)
Regulation 5 .

Amendment

Omit “and”, first occurring

Omit “(Female)" from the definition of “Dental therapist™
Omit “"Commissioner”, substitute *Chairman”

Omit “Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman™

Omit “head teacher™, substitute "principal teacher™

The Public Health (Piggeries) Regulations are amended as set out in the

foliowing table:
Provision

Regulation 2
Regulation 4 .
Sub-regulation 4 (1)
Sub-regulation 5 (3)

Sub-paragraph 6 (a) (i)
Sub-paragraph 6 (a) (i)

Paragraph 7 (1) (b)
The Schedule

Amendment

Omit “two*, substitute 2"

Omit “Commissioner” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairman”
Omit “Ten shillings”, substitute "$17

Omit “Commissioner”, substifute *"Chairman”

Omit “two ™, substitute *2"

Omit “three”, substitute '3

Ormit “carcass™ (1wice occurring), substitute “carcase™

Omit from Form A “Ten shillings”, substitute “§1"

Omit from Forms A and B *Commissioner”, substitute **Chairman™

The Public Health (Private Hospitals) Regulations are amended as set out

in the following table:

Provision
Regulation 3

Regulation 4
Regulation 6
Reguiation 7
Regulation 8
Paragraph 9 (¢)
Paragraph ¢ (d)

Amendment

Omit “Public Health (Infectious Discases) Regulations”™ from the
dehinition of "“Infectious disease™, substitute “Public Health (In-
fectious and Notifiable Diseases) Regulations™

Omit “two” and “six™ from the definition of “Private hospital”, sub-
stitute 2" and “6" respectively

Omit “Commissioner”, substitute *Chairman™

Omit “Commissioner™ (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairman™

Omit “Commissioner” (wherever oceurring), substitute “Chairman™

Omit “Commissioner” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairman™

Omit “two” (wherever occurring), substitute “27

Omit “two’', substitute “2"

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



272

Provision

Sub-regulation 10 (1)
Regulation 11

Sub-regulation 16. (]') .

Regulation 17
Paragraph 17 (h}
Schedule .

1980 No. 3

SCHEDULE—continued

Amendmem

Omit “Commissioner”, substitute “Chairman™

Omit “Commissionet™ {wherever occurring), substitute “Chairman”™
Omit *“Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman™

Omit “"Commissioner™ (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairman™
Omit “ten”, substitute *10”

Omit from Form 1 “Commissioner”, substitute “Chairman”

PUBLIC HEALTH (PROHIBITED DRUGS) ORDINANCE 1957

Regulations 1965 No. 4 (being the Public Health (Prohibited Drugs) Regu-
lations) are repealed.

The Public Health (Sale of Food and Drugs) Regulations are amended as
set out in the following table:

Provision
Regulation 3

Paragraph 4 (k)

Paragraph 11 (a)
Paragraph 14 (a)
Paragraph 14 (b)
Paragraph 14 {d)
Regulation 16
Regulation |7

Sub-regulation 19 (6)

Regulation 21

Sub-regulation 21 (1)

Regulation 25
Regulation 30

Sub-regulation 324 (4)

Regulation 39
Paragraph 39 ()
Paragraph 55 (a)
Sub-regulation 57 (4}
Sub-regulation 58 (1}
Regulation 65
Regulation 72
Reguiation 73
Regulation 83
Paragraph 83 (a)
Paragraph 83 (d)
Regulation 84
Paragraph 84 (k)
Sub-regulation 91 (1)

Sub-regulation 954 (1)

Regulation 97
Regulation 106

Amendment

Omit “Pubilc Health (Infectious Diseases) Regulations™ from the
dehnition of “Infectious disease”, substitute “Public Health (In-
fectious and Notifiable Diseases) Regulations™

Omit “Government” from the definition of “Owner”

Omit “two”, substitute *2"

Omit “centum”, substitute “cent™

Omit “three”, substitute 3"

Omit “ten per cent.”, substitute *“10%™

Omit “ten per cent.”, substitute *10%"

Omit “four per cent.”™, substitute "4%"

Omit “Commissioner™ {wherever occurring), substitute “Chairman™

Omit “"Commissioner™ {wherever occurring}), substitute “"Chairman™

Omit “three™ (twice occurring), substitute **3”

Omit “two”, substitute “2”

Omit "Commissioner”™ ( wherever occurring), substitute “Chairman”

Omit “unauthorized”, substitute “authorized”

Omit “Commissioner”, substitute *Chairman”

Omit “City Area Leases Ordinance 1924-1929", substitute “City
Area Leases Ordinance 1936"

Omit “Liquor Ordinance 1929-1954"" (wherever occurring), substi-
tute “Liguor Ordinance 19757

Omit “Commissioner™ (wherever occurring), substitute "Chairman”™

Omit “'ten”, substitute *10”

Omit “two™, substitute *2"

Omit “Commissioner”, substitute “Chairman”

Omit “eight”, substitute “8"

Omit *Commissioner” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairman”

Omit “Commissioner”, substitute “Chairman”™

Omit “Commissioner”, substitute “Chairman™

Omit “Commissioner”, substitute “Chairman”™

Omit “twelve”, substitute “127

Omit “twenty-four™, substitute “*24™

Omit “Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman™

Omit “thirty”, substitute “30

Omit “Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman™

Omit *(No. 3)” (wherever occurring)

Omit “Commissioner™, substitute “Chairman™

Omit “Commissioner” {twice occurring), substitute “Chairman™

The Public Health (Tuberculosis) Regulations are amended as set out in

the following table:

Provision
Regulation 2

Regulation 9

Amendment

Omit “Public Health (Infectious Diseases) Regulations™, substitute
“Public Health (Infectious and Notifiable Diseases) Regulations™

Omit “five”, substitute *5"

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



1980 No. 3 273

SCHEDULE —continued
RATES ORDINANCE 1926

Rules of the Valuation Court (being Rules under the Rates Ordinance 1926
made by the Judge of the Valuation Court on 2 September 1929 and notified in
the Gazette on 3 September 1929) are repealed.

RURAL WORKERS ACCOMMODATION ORDINANCE 1938

The Rural Workers Accommodation Regulations are amended as set out in
the following table:

Provision Amendment

Sub-regulation6 (4) . . . . . Omit “two”, substitute “2"
Sub-regulation 15 (1) . . . . Omit*“ten", substitute “10"
Sub-paragraph i5(2) (b) (i) . . Omit “twenty"”, substitute “20"
Paragraph L5 (2) (d) . . . . Omit*"4inches”, substitute “i0 cms”
Sub-regulation 24 (6) .. . . Omit*six", substitute “6”
Sub-regulation 42 (1) .. . . Omit*"Ten pounds”, substitute *“$20"

STOCK DISEASES ORDINANCE 1933

The Stock Diseases Regulations are amended as set out in the following
table:

Provision Amendment
Regulation 3 . . . . . . . Insertafter the definition of “stock " the following definition:
* *the Ordinance’ means the Stock Diseases Ordinance 1933
Paragraph 6 {lE) (a) . . . . Omit “Stock Diseases Act, 1922-1924" substitute “Stock Diseases
Act 1923.7
Paragraph6 (2) (b) . . .. Omit “twenty-one™, substitute “21"
Sub-paragraph 6 (2) (c) (m) .. Omit“three”, substitute 3"
Schedule 1 . .. Omit “One hundred pounds { £ 100)”, substitute “$250"
Schedule2 . . . . . . . . Omittheheading “Stock Diseases Regulations 1935”

Omit “'six”, substitute “6™

SURVEYORS ORDINANCE 1967

The Surveyors (Examination and Registration) Regulations are amended
as set out in the following table:

Provision Amendment
Regulation 2 . .+ . .+ . Repeal
Sub-regulation 7 (3) .« . . . ©Omit “three”, substitute 3"
Sub-regulation 11 (1) .« . . Omit “four”, substitute 4"
Omit “three”, substitute “3”
Sub-regulation t1 (2) . . . . Omit"two”, substitute *2"
Sub-regulation 11 (3) . . . . Omit*"six” (wherever occurring), substitute “6"
Sub-regulation 11 (4) . . . . Omit“ffteen”, substitute “15”
Sub-regulation 13 (1) .+ . . Omit from Item 1 in the table “twelve” and “six”, substitute 12"

and "6 respectively
Omit from [tem 2 “Twelve” (wherever occurring), substitute “127
Omit from Item 3 “Nine”, substitute *9"
Omit from [tem 4 “Twelve” (wherever occurring), substitute 12"
Omit from Item 5 “Eighteen”, substitute *18™
Omit from [tem 5 “twelve”, substitute 12"

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



274

Provision
Sub-regulation 14 (1)
Regulation 15

Sub-regulation 16 (1)

Sub-regulation 16 (2)
Sub-regulation 16 {3)
Paragraph 16 (5) (a)
Paragraph 16 (5} (¢)

Paragraph 16 (5} (g)
Regulation 24

Sub-regulation 26 (b) -

Paragraph 27 {a)
Paragraph 28 (c)
Paragraph 28 (d)
Paragraph 29 (&)
Paragraph 29 ()

198 No. 3

SCHEDULE —continued

Amendment

Omit “twelve™, substitute 12

Omit “two” from the subject “Field Astronomy”, substitute *2"

Omit “three™, substitute 3"

Omit “four™, substitute “4"

Omil “two", substitute *2"

Omit “two" {wherever occurring), substitute 27

Omit “thirty per centumn™ {wherever occurring), substitute *30%"

Omit “'ten thousand to twenty thousand™ (wherever occurring), sub-
stitute *10,000 to 20,000

Omit "“five thousand™, substitute *5,000"

Omit “twenty™, substilute *20"

Omit “one thousand ™, substitute **1,000"

Omit “sixty per centum”, substitute “60%"

Omit “five”, substitute “5"

Omit “two”, substitute *2"

Omit “two", substitute 2™

Omit “three™, substitute **3”

Omit “two”, substitute 2"

Omit “six”, substitute 6"

WEIGHTS AND MEASURES ORDINANCE 1929

Regulations 1942 No. 8 (being the Sale of Firewood Regulations) are

repealed.

WEIGHTS AND MEASURES (PACKAGED GOODS) ORDINANCE

1970

The Weights and Measures (Packaged Goods) Regulations are amended as

set out in the following table:

Provision
Regulation 2

Sub-paragraph 7 i]) (b) (|)
Sub-paragraph 7 (1) (b) (ii)
Sub-paragraph 7 (1) (b) (iii)

Paragraph 104 (a)

Sub-regulation 11 (4)
Paragraph 14 (1} (a)
Paragraph 14 (1) (b)
Sub-regulation 14 (5)

Paragraph 18 (3) (a)
Paragraph 18 (3) (b)

Amendment

Repeal
Omit “three”, substitute 3"
Omit “two™ (wherever occurring), substitute 2"
Omit “one hundred and twenty”, substitute *120™
Omit “three”, substitute *3"
Omit “ten thousand™, substitute *10,000™
Omit “two"”, substitute *2"
Omit “two"”, substitute *2"
Omit “The last two proceeding sub-regulations”, substitute “Sub-
regulations {3} and (4)"
Omit “Ten”, substitute 10"
Omit, substitute:
“(b) thearticle consists of —
(1) frankfurts;
(i1) minced meat;
(ili) sausage meat;
(iv) sausages;
(v) saveloys;
(v1) sliced cooked meat; or
{vit) sliced bacon,
packed in net weights of 2 ounces, 4 ounces, 6 ounces, 8 ounces, |2
ounces, one pound, 1+ pounds or in muluiples of one pound, or in
net weights of 50 grammes, 100 grammes, 125 grammes, 200
grammes, 250 grammes, 375 grammes, 500 grammes or in multi-
ples of 500 grammes”

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



1980 No. 3 275

SCHEDULE—continued

Provision Amendment

Paragraph 18 (3) (¢) . . . . Omit, substitute * ‘c’ the article consists of natural cheese packed in
net weights of 4 ounces, 6 ounces, 8 ounces, 12 ounces, one pound,
1+ pounds or in multiples of one pound, 14 pounds or in net
weights of 100 grammes, 200 grammes, 500 grammes or in mulii-

ples of 500 grammes™
Sub-regulation 19 (2) .. .. Omit “fifty six”, substitute “56”
Omit “twenty-five™, substitute *25"
Regulation20 . . . . . . . Omit“two" (wherever occurring}, substitute *2
Regulation 21A . . . . . . Omit“two" (wherever occurring), substitute “2”
Sub-regulation 22 (2) . . < . Omit"ten”, substitute “10”

Omit “four”, substitute 4™
Omit from [tem 9 “ten™, substitute 10"
SecondSchedule . . . . . .  Omit fromltem 36 “Two", substitute “2"

NOTE
1. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette on 25 March 1980,

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2012-05-04T14:49:28+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




