
Regulations 1981 No. I 1 

Motor Omnibus Fares Regulations 2 

(Amendment) 
I, WILLIAM MICHAEL HODGMAN, the Minister of State for the Capital 
Territory, hereby make the following Regulation under the Motor Omnibus 
Services Ordinance 1955. 

Dated 16 January 1981. 

MICHAEL HODGMAN 
Minister of State for the Capital Territory 

Amendments relating to fares and prices 
The Motor Omnibus Fares Regulations are amended as set out in the 

following table: 

Provision Amendment 

Sub-regulation 6A (1) . . . Omit "SI 50", substitute "$2". 
Paragraph 6A (3) (a) . . Omit "80 cents", substitute "SI". 
Paragraph 6A (3) (b) . . . Omit "70 cents", substitute "SI". 
Sub-regulation 6B (1) . . . Omit "$18", substitute "S22". 
Paragraph 6B (3) (a) Omit "$6", substitute "$8". 
Paragraph 6B (3) (b) . . . Omit "514", substitute "SI8". 
Regulation 6c Omit "SI5". substitute "S18". 
Paragraph 6D (1) (a) . . . Omit "S3.00", substitute "$4". 
Paragraph 6D (1) (b) . . . Omit "S6.00", substitute "$8". 
Paragraph 6D (I) (c) . . . Omit "$15.00", substitute "$20". 
Sub-paragraph 6D (3) (a) (i) . Omit "SI.30", substitute "SI.80". 
Sub-paragraph 6D (3) (a) (ii) . Omit "$2.60", substitute "$3.60". 
Sub-paragraph 6D (3) (a) (iii) Omit "$6.50", substitute "$9". 
Sub-paragraph 6D (3) (b) (i) . Omit "$1.00", substitute "$1.50". 
Sub-paragraph 6D (3) (b) (ii) . Omit "$2.00", substitute "$3". 
Sub-paragraph 6D (3) (b) (iii) Omit "$5.00", substitute "$7.50". 

NOTES 
1. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette on 19 January 1981. 

2. Regulations 1964 No. 7 as amended by 1966 No: 5; 1967 No . 1; 1970 No. 11; 1971 N o . 7; 
1973 No. 8; 1974 Nos. 1, 7 and 19; 1975 Nos. 1 and 20; 1976 No. 14; 1977 Nos. 2 and 14; 
1978 No. 12; 1979 No. 26; 1980 No. 2. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au


		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2012-04-30T14:22:13+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




